
Item Description (brand name or equivalent) Printing Sizes Est. Qty.  Unit Price 

 Est. 

Quantity x 

Unit Price = 

Extended 

Price 

Brand Bid

CATEGORY A

1 50/50 Heavyweight T-shirt (Gildan) 1 Color Front Adults- XL 288 4.89$           $    1,408.32 Jerzee 29M

2 50/50 Heavyweight T-shirt (Gildan) 1 Color Front Youth 400 4.77$           $    1,908.00 Jerzee 29B

3 50/50 Heavyweight T-shirt (Gildan) 1 Color Front Adult 2X 36 7.87$           $       283.32 Jerzee 29M

4 50/50 Heavyweight T-shirt (Gildan) 1 Color Front Adult 3X 12.00$    8.96$           $       107.52 Jerzee 29M

5 50/50 Heavyweight T-shirt (Gildan) 1 Color Front 1 Color Back Adult S- XL 288 5.89$           $    1,696.32 Jerzee 29M

6 50/50 Heavyweight T-shirt (Gildan) 1 Color Front 1 Color Back Adult 2X 36 6.27$           $       225.72 Jerzee 29M

7 50/50 Heavyweight T-shirt (Gildan) 1 Color Front 1 Color Back Adult 3X 12 10.37$         $       124.44 Jerzee 29M

8 50/50 Heavyweight T-shirt (Gildan) 1 Color Front 1 Color Back Youth 110 6.27$           $       689.70 Jerzee 29B

9 50/50 Heavyweight T-shirt (Gildan)
1 Color Front and 1 Color  

#/Sponsors on Back 
Youth 276 7.02$           $    1,937.52 Jerzee 29B

10 50/50 Heavyweight T-shirt (Gildan)
1 Color Front and 1 Color  

#/Sponsors on Back 
Adult S- XL 20 11.39$         $       227.80 Jerzee 29M

11 50/50 Heavyweight T-shirt (Gildan)
1 Color Front and 1 Color  

#/Sponsors on Back 
Adult 2X 20 13.82$         $       276.40 Jerzee 29M

12 50/50 Heavyweight T-shirt (Gildan)
1 Color Front and 1 Color #s on 

Back 
Adult S-XL 380 6.14$           $    2,333.20 Jerzee 29M

13 50/50 Heavyweight T-shirt (Gildan)
1 Color Front and 1 Color #s on 

Back 
Adult 2X 5 11.37$         $         56.85 Jerzee 29M

14 50/50 Heavyweight T-shirt (Gildan)
1 Color Front and 1 Color #s on 

Back 
Adult 3X 5 11.46$         $         57.30 Jerzee 29M

15 50/50 Heavyweight T-shirt (Gildan) 3 Color Front and 1 Color Back Youth 200 5.98$           $    1,196.00 Jerzee 29B

16 50/50 Heavyweight T-shirt (Gildan) 3 Color Front and 1 Color Back Adult S-XL 200 6.64$           $    1,328.00 Jerzee 29M

17 50/50 Heavyweight T-shirt (Gildan) 3 Color Front and 1 Color Back Adult 2X 36 9.87$           $       355.32 Jerzee 29M

18 50/50 Heavyweight T-shirt (Gildan) 3 Color Front and 1 Color Back Adult 3X 12 11.95$         $       143.52 Jerzee 29M

19 50/50 Heavyweight T-shirt (Gildan) 2 Color Front Adult S-XL 100 5.39$           $       539.00 Jerzee 29M

20 50/50 Heavyweight T-shirt (Gildan) 2 Color Front Adult 2X 100 7.87$           $       787.00 Jerzee 29M

21 50/50 Heavyweight T-shirt (Gildan) 2 Color Front Adult 3X 6 9.47$           $         56.76 Jerzee 29M

22 50/50 Heavyweight T-shirt (Gildan) 3 Color Front Adults- XL 288 5.39$           $    1,552.32 Jerzee 29M
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23 50/50 Heavyweight T-shirt (Gildan) 3 Color Front Youth 400 4.48$           $    1,792.00 Jerzee 29B

24 50/50 Heavyweight T-shirt (Gildan) 3 Color Front Adult 2X 36 8.37$           $       301.32 Jerzee 29M

25 50/50 Heavyweight T-shirt (Gildan) 3 Color Front Adult 3X 12 9.46$          113.52$       Jerzee 29M

CATEGORY B

Item
Description  (brand name or 

equivalent)
Printing Sizes Est. Qty.  Unit Price 

 Est. 

Quantity x 

Unit Price = 

Extended 

Price 

Brand Bid

1 Tank Tops (Gildan)
1 Color Front and 1 Color  #s on 

Back 
Adult S-XL 378 8.23$          6,110.94$    Gildan 2200

2 Tank Tops (Gildan)
1 Color Front and 1 Color  #s on 

Back 
Adult 2X 5 14.80$        74.00$         Gildan 2200

3 Tank Tops (Gildan)
1 Color Front and 1 Color  #s on 

Back 
Adult 3X 5 NO BID

4 Tank Tops (Gildan)
3 Color Front and 1 Color  #s on 

Back 
Adult S-XL 378 8.73$          3,299.94$    Gildan 2200

5 Tank Tops (Gildan)
3 Color Front and 1 Color  #s on 

Back 
Adult 2X 5 15.30$        76.50$         Gildan 2200

6 Tank Tops (Gildan)
3 Color Front and 1 Color  #s on 

Back 
Adult 3X 5 NO BID

7 Tank Tops (Gildan) 1 Color Front 1 Color Back Adult S-XL 48 8.48$          407.04$       Gildan 2200

8 Tank Tops (Gildan) 1 Color Front 1 Color Back Adult 2X 5 14.80$        74.00$         Gildan 2200

9 Tank Tops (Gildan) 3 Color Front and 1 Color Back Adult S-XL 48 8.98$          431.04$       Gildan 2200

10 Tank Tops (Gildan) 3 Color Front and 1 Color Back Adult 2X 5 15.03$        76.50$         Gildan 2200

CATEGORY C

Item
Description  (brand name or 

equivalent)
Printing Sizes Est. Qty.  Unit Price 

 Est. 

Quantity x 

Unit Price = 

Extended 

Price 

Brand Bid

                                                                                                                                         CATEGORY 

(B) TOTAL
10,549.96$                         

                                                                                                                                         CATEGORY 

(A) TOTAL
19,497.17$                         



1
100% cotton Heavyweight T-shirts 

(Gildan)
1 Color Front 1 Color Back Adult S-XL 288 5.69$          1,638.72$    Gildan 5000

2
100% cotton Heavyweight T-shirts 

(Gildan)
1 Color Front 1 Color Back Adult 2X 96 8.50$          816.00$       Gildan 5000

3
100% cotton Heavyweight T-shirts 

(Gildan)
1 Color Front 1 Color Back Adult 3X 12 11.20$        134.40$       Gildan 5000

4
100% cotton Heavyweight T-shirts 

(Gildan)
1 Color Front 1 Color Back Youth 96 5.94$          570.24$       Gildan 5000B

5
100% cotton Heavyweight T-shirts 

(Gildan)
3 Color Front and 1 Color Back Adult S-XL 288 6.19$          1,782.20$    Gildan 5000

6
100% cotton Heavyweight T-shirts 

(Gildan)
3 Color Front and 1 Color Back Adult 2X 96 9.00$          864.00$       Gildan 5000

7
100% cotton Heavyweight T-shirts 

(Gildan)
3 Color Front and 1 Color Back Adult 3X 12 11.70$        140.40$       Gildan 5000

8
100% cotton Heavyweight T-shirts 

(Gildan)
3 Color Front and 1 Color Back Youth 96 6.44$          618.24$       Gildan 5000B

9
100% cotton Heavyweight T-shirts 

(Gildan)
1 Color Front Adult S-XL 288 4.69$          1,350.72$    Gildan 5000

10
100% cotton Heavyweight T-shirts 

(Gildan)
1 Color Front Adult 2X 96 7.25$          696.00$       Gildan 5000

11
100% cotton Heavyweight T-shirts 

(Gildan)
1 Color Front Adult 3X 12 8.70$          104.40$       Gildan 5000

12
100% cotton Heavyweight T-shirts 

(Gildan)
1 Color Front Youth 96 4.44$          426.24$       Gildan 5000B

13
100% cotton Heavyweight T-shirts 

(Gildan)
2 Color Front Adult S-XL 288 4.94$          1,422.72$    Gildan 5000

14
100% cotton Heavyweight T-shirts 

(Gildan)
2 Color Front Adult 2X 96 7.50$          720.00$       Gildan 5000

15
100% cotton Heavyweight T-shirts 

(Gildan)
2 Color Front Adult 3X 12 8.95$          107.40$       Gildan 5000

16
100% cotton Heavyweight T-shirts 

(Gildan)
2 Color Front Youth 96 4.94$          474.24$       Gildan 5000B

17
100% cotton Heavyweight T-shirts 

(Gildan)
3 Color Front Adult S-XL 288 5.19$          1,494.72$    Gildan 5000

18
100% cotton Heavyweight T-shirts 

(Gildan)
3 Color Front Adult 2X 96 7.75$          744.00$       Gildan 5000

19
100% cotton Heavyweight T-shirts 

(Gildan)
3 Color Front Adult 3X 12 9.20$          110.10$       Gildan 5000

20
100% cotton Heavyweight T-shirts 

(Gildan)
3 Color Front Youth 96 5.19$          498.24$       Gildan 5000B



CATEGORY D

Item
Description  (brand name or 

equivalent)
Printing Sizes Est. Qty.  Unit Price 

 Est. 

Quantity x 

Unit Price = 

Extended 

Price 

Brand Bid

1
Crewneck Sweatshirt. 10 oz, 90/10 blend 

(Champion)
1 Color Front Adult S-XL 16 16.75$        268.00$       Hanes F260**

2
Crewneck Sweatshirt. 10 oz, 90/10 blend 

(Champion)
1 Color Front Adult 2X 6 21.75$        130.50$       Hanes F260**

3
Crewneck Sweatshirt. 10 oz, 90/10 blend 

(Champion)
1 Color Front Adult 3X 6 22.25$        133.50$       Hanes F260**           x  

4
Hooded  Sweatshirt 10 oz. 90/10 blend 

(Champion)
1 Color Front Adult S-XL 16 24.55$        392.80$       Hanes F170**

5
Hooded  Sweatshirt 10 oz. 90/10 blend 

(Champion)
1 Color Front Adult 2X 6 29.16$        174.96$       Hanes F170**

6
Hooded  Sweatshirt 10 oz. 90/10 blend 

(Champion)
1 Color Front Adult 3X 6 29.16$        174.60$       Hanes F170**

7
Crewneck Sweatshirt. 10 oz, 90/10 blend 

(Champion)
2 Color Front Adult S-XL 16 17.00$        272.00$       Hanes F260**

8
Crewneck Sweatshirt. 10 oz, 90/10 blend 

(Champion)
2 Color Front Adult 2X 6 22.00$        132.00$       Hanes F260**

9
Crewneck Sweatshirt. 10 oz, 90/10 blend 

(Champion)
2 Color Front Adult 3X 6 22.50$        135.00$       Hanes F260**

10
Hooded  Sweatshirt 10 oz. 90/10 blend 

(Champion)
2 Color Front Adult S-XL 16 24.80$        396.80$       Hanes F170**

11
Hooded  Sweatshirt 10 oz. 90/10 blend 

(Champion)
2 Color Front Adult 2X 6 29.41$        176.46$       Hanes F170**

12
Hooded  Sweatshirt 10 oz. 90/10 blend 

(Champion)
2 Color Front Adult 3X 6 29.41$        176.46$       Hanes F170**

13
Crewneck Sweatshirt. 10 oz, 90/10 blend 

(Champion)
3 Color Front Adult S-XL 16 17.25$        276.00$       Hanes F260**

14
Crewneck Sweatshirt. 10 oz, 90/10 blend 

(Champion)
3 Color Front Adult 2X 6 22.25$        133.50$       Hanes F260**

15
Crewneck Sweatshirt. 10 oz, 90/10 blend 

(Champion)
3 Color Front Adult 3X 6 22.75$        136.50$       Hanes F260**

                                                                                                                                         CATEGORY 

(C) TOTAL
13,074.26$                         

NOTICE: LIMITED COLRS  **



16
Hooded  Sweatshirt 10 oz. 90/10 blend 

(Champion)
3 Color Front Adult S-XL 16 26.05$        416.80$       Hanes F170**

17
Hooded  Sweatshirt 10 oz. 90/10 blend 

(Champion)
3 Color Front Adult 2X 6 29.66$        177.96$       Hanes F170**

18
Hooded  Sweatshirt 10 oz. 90/10 blend 

(Champion)
3 Color Front Adult 3X 6 29.66$        416.80$       Hanes F170**

19 Hooded sweatshirt 9 oz 50/50 (Champion) 1 Color Front Adult S-XL 6 27.00$        162.00$       Champion S600**

20 Hooded sweatshirt 9 oz 50/50 (Champion) 1 Color Front Adult 2X 2 30.07$        60.14$         Champion S600**

21
Hooded Zipper sweatshirt/ 9 oz. 50% 

cotton, 50% polyester (Champion)
1 Color Front Adult S-XL 16 27.83$        445.28$       Champion CN343**

22
Hooded Zipper sweatshirt/ 9 oz. 50% 

cotton, 50% polyester (Champion)
1 Color Front Adult 2X 2 29.38$        58.76$         Champion CN343**

23 Hooded sweatshirt 9 oz 50/50 (Champion) 1 Color Front Adult S-XL 100 25.75$        2,575.00$    Champion S600**

24 Hooded sweatshirt 9 oz 50/50 (Champion) 1 Color Front Adult 2X 4 30.07$        202.28$       Champion S600**

25
Hooded sweatshirt reversible weave 

(Champion)
1 Color Front Adult S-XL 16 31.72$        507.52$       Champion CN375**

26
Hooded sweatshirt reversible weave 

(Champion)
1 Color Front Adult 2X 6 34.81$        208.86$       Champion CN375**

27
Nublend Hooded Zipper sweatshirt 50% 

cotton, 50% polyester (Jerzees)
1 Color Front Adult S-XL 16 25.88$        414.08$       Jerzee 993M**

28
Nublend Hooded Zipper sweatshirt 50% 

cotton, 50% polyester (Jerzees)
1 Color Front Adult 2X 6 29.65$        177.90$       Jerzee 993M**

29
Hooded Zipper sweatshirt 9.5 oz 50% 

cotton, 50% polyester (Jerzees)
1 Color Front Adult S-XL 16 32.38$        518.08$       Jerzee 4999M**

30
Hooded Zipper sweatshirt 9.5 oz 50% 

cotton, 50% polyester (Jerzees)
1 Color Front Adult 2X 6 35.37$        212.22$       Jerzee 4999M**

31
Hooded sweatshirt 9.5 oz 50% cotton, 

50% polyester (Jerzees)
1 Color Front Adult S-XL 16 23.12$        369.92$       Jerzee 4997M

32
Hooded sweatshirt 9.5 oz 50% cotton, 

50% polyester (Jerzees)
1 Color Front Adult 2X 6 27.60$        165.60$       Jerzee 4997M

33
Z class Hooded sweatshirt 50% cotton, 

50% polyester (Jerzees)
1 Color Front Adult S-XL 100 $ NO BID

34
Z class Hooded sweatshirt 50% cotton, 

50% polyester (Jerzees)
1 Color Front Adult 2X 4 $ NO BID

35
Hooded sweatshirt 9.5 oz 50% cotton, 

50% polyester (Jerzees)
1 Color Front Adult S-XL 100 21.87$        2,187.00$    Jerzee 4997M



36
Hooded sweatshirt 9.5 oz 50% cotton, 

50% polyester (Jerzees)
1 Color Front Adult 2X 4 27.60$        102.40$       Jerzee 4997M

37
Hooded Zipper sweatshirt 9.5 oz 50% 

cotton, 50% polyester (Jerzees)
1 Color Front Adult S-XL 100 24.63$        2,463.00$    Jerzee 993M**

38
Hooded Zipper sweatshirt 9.5 oz 50% 

cotton, 50% polyester (Jerzees)
1 Color Front Adult 2X 4 29.65$        1,186.00$    Jerzee 993M**

39
Fruit of the Loom Full-Zip Hoodie 12 oz 

Super Cotton 70/30
1 Color Front Adult S-XL 16 16.12$        257.92$       FOL #FL375**

40
Fruit of the Loom Full-Zip Hoodie 12 oz 

Super Cotton 70/30
1 Color Front Adult 2X 6 19.79$        118.74$       FOL #FL375**

41
Champion Reverse Weave 12 oz Pull 

Over Hoodie 
1 Color Front Adult S-XL 16 $ NO BID

42
Champion Reverse Weave 12 oz Pull 

Over Hoodie 
1 Color Front Adult 2X 6 $ NO BID

43 Champion Hooded sweatshirt 9 oz 50/50 2 Color Front Adult S-XL 16 23.52$        376.32$       Champion CN345**

44 Champion Hooded sweatshirt 9 oz 50/50 2 Color Front Adult 2X 2 25.06$        50.12$         Champion CN345**

45
Champion Hooded Zipper sweatshirt/ 9 

oz. 50% cotton, 50% polyester
2 Color Front Adult S-XL 16 28.10$        449.60$       Champion CN342**

46
Champion Hooded Zipper sweatshirt/ 9 

oz. 50% cotton, 50% polyester
2 Color Front Adult 2X 2 29.63$        59.26$         Champion CN342**

47 Champion Hooded sweatshirt 9 oz 50/50 2 Color Front Adult S-XL 100 22.27$        2,227.00$    Champion CN345**

48 Champion Hooded sweatshirt 9 oz 50/50 2 Color Front Adult 2X 4 29.63$        118.52$       Champion CN345**

49
Champion Hooded sweatshirt reversible 

weave
2 Color Front Adult S-XL 16 $ NO BID

50
Champion Hooded sweatshirt reversible 

weave
2 Color Front Adult 2X 6 $ NO BID

51
Jerzees Nublend Hooded Zipper 

sweatshirt 50% cotton, 50% polyester
2 Color Front Adult S-XL 16 26.13$        418.08$       Jerzee 993M**

52
Jerzees Nublend Hooded Zipper 

sweatshirt 50% cotton, 50% polyester
2 Color Front Adult 2X 6 29.90$        179.40$       Jerzee 993M**

53
Jerzees Hooded Zipper sweatshirt 9.5 oz 

50% cotton, 50% polyester
2 Color Front Adult S-XL 16 32.63$        522.08$       Jerzee 4999M**

54
Jerzees Hooded Zipper sweatshirt 9.5 oz 

50% cotton, 50% polyester
2 Color Front Adult 2X 6 35.62$        213.72$       Jerzee 4999M**

55
Jerzees Hooded sweatshirt 9.5 oz 50% 

cotton, 50% polyester
2 Color Front Adult S-XL 16 23.37$        373.92$       Jerzee 4997M**



56
Jerzees Hooded sweatshirt 9.5 oz 50% 

cotton, 50% polyester
2 Color Front Adult 2X 6 27.85$        167.10$       Jerzee 4997M**

57
Jerzees Z class Hooded sweatshirt 50% 

cotton, 50% polyester
2 Color Front Adult S-XL 100 $ NO BID

58
Jerzees Z class Hooded  sweatshirt 50% 

cotton, 50% polyester
2 Color Front Adult 2X 4 $ NO BID

59
Jerzees Hooded sweatshirt 9.5 oz 50% 

cotton, 50% polyester
2 Color Front Adult S-XL 100 22.12$        2,212.00$    Jerzee 4997M**

60
Jerzees Hooded sweatshirt 9.5 oz 50% 

cotton, 50% polyester
2 Color Front Adult 2X 4 27.85$        111.40$       Jerzee 4997M**

61
Jerzees Hooded Zipper sweatshirt 9.5 oz 

50% cotton, 50% polyester
2 Color Front Adult S-XL 100 31.38$        3,138.00$    Jerzee 4999M**

62
Jerzees Hooded Zipper sweatshirt 9.5 oz 

50% cotton, 50% polyester
2 Color Front Adult 2X 4 35.62$        142.48$       Jerzee 4999M**

63
Fruit of the Loom Full-Zip Hoodie 12 oz 

Super Cotton 70/30
2 Color Front Adult S-XL 16 15.75$        252.00$       FOL #FL375**

64
Fruit of the Loom Full-Zip Hoodie 12 oz 

Super Cotton 70/30
2 Color Front Adult 2X 6 16.37$        98.22$         FOL #FL375**

65
Champion Reverse Weave 12 oz Pull 

Over Hoodie 
2 Color Front Adult S-XL 16 $ NO BID

66
Champion Reverse Weave 12 oz Pull 

Over Hoodie 
2 Color Front Adult 2X 6 $ NO BID

67 Champion Hooded sweatshirt 9 oz 50/50 3 Color Front Adult S-XL 16 23.77$        380.32$       Champion CN345**

68 Champion Hooded sweatshirt 9 oz 50/50 3 Color Front Adult 2X 2 29.88$        59.76$         Champion CN345**

69
Champion Hooded Zipper sweatshirt/ 9 

oz. 50% cotton, 50% polyester
3 Color Front Adult S-XL 16 28.35$        453.60$       Champion CN343**

70
Champion Hooded Zipper sweatshirt/ 9 

oz. 50% cotton, 50% polyester
3 Color Front Adult 2X 2 29.88$        59.76$         Champion CN343**

71 Champion Hooded sweatshirt 9 oz 50/50 3 Color Front Adult S-XL 100 22.52$        2,252.00$    Champion CN345**

72 Champion Hooded sweatshirt 9 oz 50/50 3 Color Front Adult 2X 4 29.88$        119.52$       Champion CN345**

73
Champion Hooded sweatshirt reversible 

weave
3 Color Front Adult S-XL 16 $ NO BID

74
Champion Hooded sweatshirt reversible 

weave
3 Color Front Adult 2X 6 $ NO BID

75
Jerzees Nublend Hooded Zipper 

sweatshirt 50% cotton, 50% polyester
3 Color Front Adult S-XL 16 26.38$        422.08$       Jerzee 993M**



76
Jerzees Nublend Hooded Zipper 

sweatshirt 50% cotton, 50% polyester
3 Color Front Adult 2X 6 30.15$        180.90$       Jerzee 993M**

77
Jerzees Hooded Zipper sweatshirt 9.5 oz 

50% cotton, 50% polyester
3 Color Front Adult S-XL 16 32.88$        526.08$       Jerzee 4999M**

78
Jerzees Hooded Zipper sweatshirt 9.5 oz 

50% cotton, 50% polyester
3 Color Front Adult 2X 6 35.87$        215.22$       Jerzee 4999M**

79
Jerzees Hooded sweatshirt 9.5 oz 50% 

cotton, 50% polyester
3 Color Front Adult S-XL 16 23.60$        377.60$       Jerzee 4997M**

80
Jerzees Hooded sweatshirt 9.5 oz 50% 

cotton, 50% polyester
3 Color Front Adult 2X 6 28.10$        168.60$       Jerzee 4997M**

81
Jerzees Z class Hooded sweatshirt 50% 

cotton, 50% polyester
3 Color Front Adult S-XL 100 $ NO BID

82
Jerzees Z class Hooded  sweatshirt 50% 

cotton, 50% polyester
3 Color Front Adult 2X 4 $ NO BID

83
Jerzees Hooded sweatshirt 9.5 oz 50% 

cotton, 50% polyester
3 Color Front Adult S-XL 100 22.37$        2,237.00$    Jerzee 4997M**

84
Jerzees Hooded sweatshirt 9.5 oz 50% 

cotton, 50% polyester
3 Color Front Adult 2X 4 28.10$        112.40$       Jerzee 4997M**

85
Jerzees Hooded Zipper sweatshirt 9.5 oz 

50% cotton, 50% polyester
3 Color Front Adult S-XL 100 31.63$        3,163.00$    Jerzee 4999M**

86
Jerzees Hooded Zipper sweatshirt 9.5 oz 

50% cotton, 50% polyester
3 Color Front Adult 2X 4 35.87$        143.48$       Jerzee 4999M**

87
Fruit of the Loom Full-Zip Hoodie 12 oz 

Super Cotton 70/30
3 Color Front Adult S-XL 100 25.02$        2,502.00$    FOL #FL372**

88
Fruit of the Loom Full-Zip Hoodie 12 oz 

Super Cotton 70/30
3 Color Front Adult 2X 4 26.77$        107.08$       FOL #FL372**

89
Champion Reverse Weave 12 oz Pull 

Over Hoodie 
3 Color Front Adult S-XL 100 $ NO BID

90
Champion Reverse Weave 12 oz Pull 

Over Hoodie 
3 Color Front Adult 2X 4 $ NO BID

CATEGORY E

Item
Description  (brand name or 

equivalent)
Printing Sizes Est. Qty.  Unit Price 

 Est. 

Quantity x 

Unit Price = 

Extended 

Price 

Brand Bid

1 100% cotton pique sportshirts (Gildan) 1 Color Left Chest Imprint Adult S-XL 100 14.50$        1,450.00$    Gildan 3800**

                                                                                                                                         CATEGORY 

(D) TOTAL
41,102.88$                         

Notice: Limited Colors availible**



2 100% cotton pique sportshirts (Gildan) 1 Color Left Chest Imprint Adult 2X 24 15.70$        1,570.00$    Gildan 3800**

3 100% cotton pique sportshirts (Gildan) 1 Color Left Chest Imprint Adult 3X 12 18.21$        218.52$       Gildan 3800**

4 100% cotton pique sportshirts (Gildan) 2 Color Left Chest Imprint Adult S-XL 100 14.75$        1,475.00$    Gildan 3800**

5 100% cotton pique sportshirts (Gildan) 2 Color Left Chest Imprint Adult 2X 24 15.95$        382.80$       Gildan 3800**

6 100% cotton pique sportshirts (Gildan) 2 Color Left Chest Imprint Adult 3X 12 18.46$        221.52$       Gildan 3800**

7 100% cotton pique sportshirts (Gildan) 3 Color Left Chest Imprint Adult S-XL 100 15.00$        1,500.00$    Gildan 3800**

8 100% cotton pique sportshirts (Gildan) 3 Color Left Chest Imprint Adult 2X 24 16.20$        388.80$       Gildan 3800**

9 100% cotton pique sportshirts (Gildan) 3 Color Left Chest Imprint Adult 3X 12 18.70$        224.40$       Gildan 3800**

10 100% Polyester 6 oz Mens Polo (Gildan) 1 Color Left Chest Imprint Adult S-XL 100 $19.65 1,965.00 Port Authority K525**

11 100% Polyester 6 oz Mens Polo (Gildan) 1 Color Left Chest Imprint Adult 2X 24 26.06$        625.44$       Port Authority K525**

12 100% Polyester 6 oz Mens Polo (Gildan) 1 Color Left Chest Imprint Adult 3X 24 29.13$        699.12$       Port Authority K525**

13
100% Polyester 6 oz Womens Polo 

(Gildan)
1 Color Left Chest Imprint Adult S-XL 100 19.65$        1,965.00$    Port Authority K525**

14
100% Polyester 6 oz Womens Polo 

(Gildan)
1 Color Left Chest Imprint Adult 2X 24 26.06$        625.44$       Port Authority K525**

15
100% Polyester 6 oz Womens Polo 

(Gildan)
1 Color Left Chest Imprint Adult 3X 24 29.13$        699.12$       Port Authority K525**

16 100% Polyester 6 oz Mens Polo (Gildan) 2 Color Left Chest Imprint Adult S-XL 100 19.90$        1,990.00$    Port Authority K525**

17 100% Polyester 6 oz Mens Polo (Gildan) 2 Color Left Chest Imprint Adult 2X 24 26.31$        631.44$       Port Authority K525**

18 100% Polyester 6 oz Mens Polo (Gildan) 2 Color Left Chest Imprint Adult 3X 24 29.38$        705.12$       Port Authority K525**

19
100% Polyester 6 oz Womens Polo 

(Gildan)
2 Color Left Chest Imprint Adult S-XL 100 19.90$        1,990.00$    Port Authority L525**

20
100% Polyester 6 oz Womens Polo 

(Gildan)
2 Color Left Chest Imprint Adult 2X 24 26.31$        631.44$       Port Authority L525**

21
100% Polyester 6 oz Womens Polo 

(Gildan)
2 Color Left Chest Imprint Adult 3X 24 29.68$        705.12$       Port Authority L525**

22 100% Polyester 6 oz Mens Polo (Gildan) 3 Color Left Chest Imprint Adult S-XL 100 20.15$        2,015.00$    Port Authority L525**

23 100% Polyester 6 oz Mens Polo (Gildan) 3 Color Left Chest Imprint Adult 2X 24 26.56$        637.44$       Port Authority L525**

24 100% Polyester 6 oz Mens Polo (Gildan) 3 Color Left Chest Imprint Adult 3X 24 29.63$        711.12$       Port Authority L525**



25
100% Polyester 6 oz Womens Polo 

(Gildan)
3 Color Left Chest Imprint Adult S-XL 100 20.15$        2,015.00$    Port Authority L525**

26
100% Polyester 6 oz Womens Polo 

(Gildan)
3 Color Left Chest Imprint Adult 2X 24 26.56$        637.44$       Port Authority L525**

27
100% Polyester 6 oz Womens Polo 

(Gildan)
3 Color Left Chest Imprint Adult 3X 24 29.63$        711.12$       Port Authority L525**

CATEGORY F

Item
Description  (brand name or 

equivalent)
Printing Sizes Est. Qty.  Unit Price 

 Est. 

Quantity x 

Unit Price = 

Extended 

Price 

Brand Bid

1 Long sleeve T-shirt (Gildan)  1 Color Front and 1 Color Back Adult S-XL 30 9.23 392.3 Badger 5104

2 Long sleeve T-shirt (Gildan)  1 Color Front and 1 Color Back Adult 2X 30 10.23 306.9 Badger 5104

3 Long sleeve T-shirt (Gildan)  1 Color Front and 1 Color Back Adult 3X 30 11.23 336.9 Badger 5104

4 Long sleeve T-shirt (Gildan)  1 Color Front Adult S-XL 30 7.73 231.9 Badger 5104

5 Long sleeve T-shirt (Gildan)  1 Color Front Adult 2X 30 8.73 261.9 Badger 5104

6 Long sleeve T-shirt (Gildan)  1 Color Front Adult 3X 30 9.73 291.9 Badger 5104

7 Long sleeve T-shirt (Gildan) 3 Color Front and 1 Color Back Adult S-XL 36 9.73 350.28 Badger 5104

8 Long sleeve T-shirt (Gildan) 3 Color Front and 1 Color Back Adult 2X 6 12.73 76.38 Badger 5104

9 Long sleeve T-shirt (Gildan) 3 Color Front and 1 Color Back Adult 3X 6 13.72 82.32 Badger 5104

10 Long sleeve T-shirt (Gildan) 3 Color Front Adult S-XL 36 8.23 296.28 Badger 5104

11 Long sleeve T-shirt (Gildan) 3 Color Front Adult 2X 6 10.23 61.38 Badger 5104

12 Long sleeve T-shirt (Gildan) 3 Color Front Adult 3X 6 11.23 67.38 Badger 5104

13 Long sleeve T-shirt (Gildan) 2 Color Front Adult S-XL 144 7.73 1,113.12 Badger 5104

14 Long sleeve T-shirt (Gildan) 2 Color Front Adult 2X 6 8.98 53.88 Badger 5104

CATEGORY G

                                                                                                                                         CATEGORY (F) 

TOTAL
3,916.82$                           

                                                                                                                                         CATEGORY (E) 

TOTAL
25,442.35$                         



Item
Description  (brand name or 

equivalent)
Printing Sizes Est. Qty.  Unit Price 

 Est. 

Quantity x 

Unit Price = 

Extended 

Price 

Brand Bid

1
Cool and dry pebble-knot polo (8240 Ultra 

Club)--men
 1 Color Front Adult S-XL 36 19.90$        716.40$       Port Auth K525

2
Cool and dry pebble-knot polo (8240 Ultra 

Club)--men
 1 Color Front Adult 2X 6 27.06$        162.36$       Port Auth K525

3
Cool and dry pebble-knot polo (8240 Ultra 

Club)--men
 1 Color Front Adult 3X 2 30.13$        60.26$         Port Auth K525

4
Cool and dry pebble-knot polo (8240L 

Ultra Club)--women
 1 Color Front Adult S-XL 36 19.90$        716.40$       Port Auth L525

5
Cool and dry pebble-knot polo (8240L 

Ultra Club)--women
 1 Color Front Adult 2X 6 27.06$        162.36$       Port Auth L525

6
Cool and dry pebble-knot polo (8240L 

Ultra Club)--women
 1 Color Front Adult 3X 2 30.13$        60.26$         Port Auth L525

7
Cool and dry pebble-knot polo (8240 Ultra 

Club)--men
 3 Color Front Adult S-XL 36 20.40$        734.40$       Port Auth K525

8
Cool and dry pebble-knot polo (8240 Ultra 

Club)--men
 3 Color Front Adult 2X 6 27.56$        165.36$       Port Auth K525

9
Cool and dry pebble-knot polo (8240 Ultra 

Club)--men
 3 Color Front Adult 3X 2 30.63$        61.26$         Port Auth K525

10
Cool and dry pebble-knot polo (8240L 

Ultra Club)--women
 3 Color Front Adult S-XL 36 20.40$        734.40$       Port Auth L525

11
Cool and dry pebble-knot polo (8240L 

Ultra Club)--women
 3 Color Front Adult 2X 6 27.56$        165.36$       Port Auth L525

12
Cool and dry pebble-knot polo (8240L 

Ultra Club)--women
 3 Color Front Adult 3X 2 30.63$        61.26$         Port Auth L525

13
Cool and dry pebble-knot polo (8240 Ultra 

Club)--men
 3 Color Front Embroidery Adult S-XL 36 23.90$        860.40$       Port Auth K525

14
Cool and dry pebble-knot polo (8240 Ultra 

Club)--men
 3 Color Front Embroidery Adult 2X 6 30.56$        183.36$       Port Auth K525

15
Cool and dry pebble-knot polo (8240 Ultra 

Club)--men
 3 Color Front Embroidery Adult 3X 2 33.63$        67.26$         Port Auth K525

16
Cool and dry pebble-knot polo (8240L 

Ultra Club)--women
 3 Color Front Embroidery Adult S-XL 36 23.90$        860.40$       Port Auth L525

17
Cool and dry pebble-knot polo (8240L 

Ultra Club)--women
 3 Color Front Embroidery Adult 2X 6 30.56$        183.36$       Port Auth L525

18
Cool and dry pebble-knot polo (8240L 

Ultra Club)--women
 3 Color Front Embroidery Adult 3X 2 33.63$        67.26$         Port Auth L525



CATEGORY H

Item
Description  (brand name or 

equivalent)
Printing Sizes Est. Qty.  Unit Price 

 Est. 

Quantity x 

Unit Price = 

Extended 

Price 

Brand Bid

1
Cool and dry sport performance interlock 

tee (8420 Ultra Club)--men
 1 Color Front Adult S-XL 36 8.14$          293.04$       Badger B-core 4120

2
Cool and dry sport performance interlock 

tee (8420 Ultra Club)--men
 1 Color Front Adult 2X 6 10.14$        60.84$         Badger B-core 4120

3
Cool and dry sport performance interlock 

tee (8420 Ultra Club)--men
 1 Color Front Adult 3X 2 11.14$        22.28$         Badger B-core 4120

4
Cool and dry sport performance interlock 

tee (8420L Ultra Club)--women
 1 Color Front Adult S-XL 36 8.14$          293.04$       Badger B-core 4162

5
Cool and dry sport performance interlock 

tee (8420L Ultra Club)--women
 1 Color Front Adult 2X 6 10.14$        60.84$         Badger B-core 4162

6
Cool and dry sport performance interlock 

tee (8420L Ultra Club)--women
 1 Color Front Adult 3X 2 11.14$        22.28$         Badger B-core 4162

7

Cool & Dry Sport Performance 

Interlock Tee (8420 UltraClub)--Men's 

' 

 3 Color Front Adult S-XL 36 8.64$          311.04$       Badger B-core 4120

8

Cool & Dry Sport Performance 

Interlock Tee (8420 UltraClub)--Men's 

' 

 3 Color Front Adult 2X 6 10.64$        63.84$         Badger B-core 4120

9

Cool & Dry Sport Performance 

Interlock Tee (8420 UltraClub)--Men's 

' 

 3 Color Front Adult 3X 2 11.64$        23.28$         Badger B-core 4120

10

Cool & Dry Sport Performance 

Interlock Tee (8420L UltraClub)-

women

 3 Color Front Adult S-XL 36 8.64$          311.04$       Badger B-core 4162

                                                                                                                                         CATEGORY 

(G) TOTAL
6,021.12$                           



11

Cool & Dry Sport Performance 

Interlock Tee (8420L UltraClub)-

women

 3 Color Front Adult 2X 6 10.64$        63.84$         Badger B-core 4162

12

Cool & Dry Sport Performance 

Interlock Tee (8420L UltraClub)-

women

 3 Color Front Adult 3X 2 11.64$        23.28$         Badger B-core 4162

13
Sport Tek Posicharge Competitor 

Short Sleeve T-Shirt Mens
 1 Color Front Adult S-XL 36 9.60$          273.60$       Sport Tek ST350

14
Sport Tek Posicharge Competitor 

Short Sleeve T-Shirt Mens
 1 Color Front Adult 2X 6 10.10$        60.60$         Sport Tek ST350

15
Sport Tek Posicharge Competitor 

Short Sleeve T-Shirt Womens
 1 Color Front Adult S-XL 36 6.85$          245.52$       Sport Tek LST350

16
Sport Tek Posicharge Competitor 

Short Sleeve T-Shirt Womens
 1 Color Front Adult 2X 6 9.37$          562.20$       Sport Tek LST350

17
Sport Tek Posicharge Competitor 

Short Sleeve T-Shirt Mens
 3 Color Front Adult S-XL 36 8.10$          291.60$       Sport Tek ST350

18
Sport Tek Posicharge Competitor 

Short Sleeve T-Shirt Mens
 3 Color Front Adult 2X 6 10.60$        63.60$         Sport Tek ST350

19
Sport Tek Posicharge Competitor 

Short Sleeve T-Shirt Womens
 3 Color Front Adult S-XL 36 7.32$          263.52$       Sport Tek LST350

20
Sport Tek Posicharge Competitor 

Short Sleeve T-Shirt Womens
 3 Color Front Adult 2X 6 9.87$          59.22$         Sport Tek LST350

CATEGORY I 

Item
Description  (brand name or 

equivalent)
Printing Sizes Est. Qty.  Unit Price 

 Est. 

Quantity x 

Unit Price = 

Extended 

Price 

Brand Bid

                                                                                                                                         CATEGORY 

(H) TOTAL
3,368.47$                           



1
Ultra cotton 100% preshrunk heavyweight 

t-shirt Navy, white or gray (6.1oz Gildan) 

 4"x3 1/4" patch front chest (one 

color--white, silver or black) 
 M, L, XL 24 9.80$          235.20$       Gildan 5000**

2
Ultra cotton 100% preshrunk heavyweight 

t-shirt Navy, white or gray (6.1oz Gildan) 

 4"x3 1/4" patch front chest (one 

color--white, silver or black) 
 2X to 4X 12 12.22$        146.64$       Gildan 5000**

3
Ultra cotton 100% preshrunk heavyweight 

t-shirt Navy, white or gray (6.1oz Gildan) 

 4"x3 1/4" patch front chest (7 

different colors) 
 M, L, XL 24 10.80$        259.20$       Gildan 5000**

4
Ultra cotton 100% preshrunk heavyweight 

t-shirt Navy, white or gray (6.1oz Gildan) 

 4"x3 1/4" patch front chest (7 

different colors) 
 2X to 4X 12 14.22$        170.64$       Gildan 5000**

5

Ultra cotton 100% preshrunk heavyweight 

long sleeve t-shirt Navy, white or gray 

(6.1oz Gildan) 

 4"x3 1/4" patch front chest (one 

color--white, silver or black) 
 M, L, XL 24 11.65$        279.60$       Gildan 5400**

6

Ultra cotton 100% preshrunk heavyweight 

long sleeve t-shirt Navy, white or gray 

(6.1oz Gildan) 

 4"x3 1/4" patch front chest (one 

color--white, silver or black) 
 2X to 4X 12 13.30$        159.60$       Gildan 5400**

7

Ultra cotton 100% preshrunk heavyweight 

long sleeve t-shirt Navy, white or gray 

(6.1oz Gildan) 

 4"x3 1/4" patch front chest (7 

different colors) 
 M, L, XL 36 12.65$        455.40$       Gildan 5400**

8

Ultra cotton 100% preshrunk heavyweight 

long sleeve t-shirt Navy, white or gray 

(6.1oz Gildan) 

 4"x3 1/4" patch front chest (7 

different colors) 
 2X to 4X 24 15.30$        367.20$       Gildan 5400**

9

Heavyweight fleece crew neck sweatshirt, 

13 ounce, 80% cotton/20% polyester in 

navy, black or gray (Dickies)

 4"x3 1/4" patch front chest (one 

color--white, silver or black) 
 M, L, XL 24 36.23$        869.52$       Champion CN375

10

Heavyweight fleece crew neck sweatshirt, 

13 ounce, 80% cotton/20% polyester in 

navy, black or gray (Dickies)

 4"x3 1/4" patch front chest (one 

color--white, silver or black) 
 2X to 4X 12 39.23$        470.76$       Champion CN375

11

Heavyweight fleece crew neck sweatshirt, 

13 ounce, 80% cotton/20% polyester in 

navy, black or gray (Dickies)

 4"x3 1/4" patch front chest (7 

different colors) 
 M, L, XL 24 41.25$        990.00$       Champion CN375

12

Heavyweight fleece crew neck sweatshirt, 

13 ounce, 80% cotton/20% polyester in 

navy, black or gray (Dickies)

 4"x3 1/4" patch front chest (7 

different colors) 
 2X to 4X 12 44.25$        531.00$       Champion CN375



0%

0%

0%

Contact your local RIDDELL sales representative; Michael Frauenheim for details at: mfrauenheim@riddellsales.com

or by phone at  908-625-7774  or by phone at: 908-625-7774

BID PRICES SHALL BE BASED ON COLORS. DISCOUNT FOR WHITE SIZES (ADULT 2X)

BID PRICES SHALL BE BASED ON COLORS. DISCOUNT FOR WHITE  SIZES (ADULT 3X)

CATEGORY (I) TOTAL 4,934.76$                           

The following  discount applies to Tee Shirts long sleeve, short sleeve 

and tank tops:

     BID PRICES SHALL BE BASED ON COLORS. DISCOUNT FOR WHITE SIZES (ADULT S-XL)


